Freedom of information Request

Housing, Health & Safety Ratings System

Question 2007/8 2008/9 2009/10
How many referrals were No longer 19 32
received and how many available due 18 32
inspections carried out. to change in
| computer
system
How many inspections This This This

were carried out in
a) Privately owned
b) Social Rented

¢) privately rented

information is
not recorded

information is
not recorded

information is
not recorded

How many inspections
resulted in hazards being
identified in each ratings
category (broken down by
tenure) for:

a) Crowding & Space

b) Excess Cold

¢) Damp & Mould

d) Falling/trip hazards

This
information is
not recorded

This
information is
not recorded

This
information is
not recorded

How many .

a) Prohibition Orders 0 18R, 1PR 1 PR
b) iImprovement Notices 18R, 2PR 0 0
¢) Emergency Remedial 1SR 0 0
Action
d) Hazard Awareness 0 0 0
Notices
were served in each tenure
category
How many times did your No longer 7 18
authority take informal available due
action te change in

computer

system
How many prosecutions 0 0 0
have been initiated.
How many times has your |0 1 0

authority carried out works
in default.




